
Adult Education 
English as a Second 
Language  

AESL 701T 
BASIC LITERACY: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department designed for students who 
cannot read or write in English. They may 
or may not be literate in their primary 
language. Students will be introduced to 
the basic concepts of literacy in English. 
Students will learn to recognize and write 
the alphabet and numbers, to form 
English words and to develop their 
abilities to speak and understand English.  
R-E-99 

AESL 702T 
BEGINNING LOW: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have emerging literacy skills in 
English. Students will practice 
communication skills in everyday 
situations and build vocabulary through 
listening, speaking, reading, writing and 
grammar activities.  R-E-99 

AESL 703T 
BEGINNING HIGH: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have basic English language skills. 
Students will learn and communicate in 
everyday situations and build a larger 
vocabulary through listening, speaking, 
reading, writing and grammar activities. 
There will be emphasis on comprehending 
simple conversations, communicating 
survival needs, reading phrases and simple 
sentences, and performing communicative 
written tasks.   R-E-99 

AESL 704T 
INTERMEDIATE LOW: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have intermediate language skills in 
English. Students will improve their 
listening comprehension, speaking, 
reading, writing and grammar. There will 
be emphasis on creative oral language 
activities, initial critical thinking skills in 
reading comprehension, and written tasks 
which begin to focus on academic skills.
 R-E-99 

AESL 705T 
INTERMEDIATE  HIGH: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have intermediate language skills in 
English. Students will improve their 
listening comprehension, speaking, 
reading, writing and grammar. Emphasis 
will be on understanding higher level 
language activities, reading passages with 
increased understanding, and increasing 
focus on creative and academic writing 

tasks.  R-E-99

AESL 706T 
ADVANCED LOW: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have a low-advanced level of 
proficiency in written English. Students will 
improve their reading, composition, 
grammar, listening comprehension, 
speaking, and study skills to prepare them 
for credit courses or high school 
equivalency (HSE) preparation courses. 
Emphasizes understanding higher level 
language activities, reading passages with 
increased understanding, and increasing 
focus on creative and academic writing 
tasks.   R-E-99 

AESL 707T 
ADVANCED HIGH: ADULT 
EDUCATION ENGLISH AS A 
SECOND LANGUAGE 
0 Unit; 8 hours lecture; 1 hour lab  
This is a non-credit, open enrollment life 
skills course within the Adult Education 
Department that is designed for students 
who have high-advanced level of 
proficiency in written English. Students will 
improve their reading, composition, 
grammar, listening comprehension, 
speaking, and study skills to prepare them 
for credit courses or high school 
equivalency (HSE) preparation courses. 
Emphasis will be on higher level language 
activities, conversations which convey 
complex thought patterns, authentic 
material which expands the use of critical 
thinking skills, and realistic and academic 
writing.  R-E-99 

Adult Education 
Citizenship 

AESL 708T 
CITIZENSHIP PREPARATION: 
ADULT EDUCATION ESL 
0 Unit; 5 hours lecture;1 hour lab  
A course in citizenship preparation within 
the Adult Education Department which 
provides development in listening, 
speaking, reading, and writing English 
within the context of history and 
government in preparation for the United 
States Citizenship examination. 
Recommended for students who have 
completed Beginning High ESL course or 
score at least 201 on CASAS placement 
test.  R-E-99
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